
OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 

2026

ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION



COMPANY NAME
ITEM (Delivered) QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE 
23A Dolomite delivered to Hart TON NO BID TON $26.45 TON ***$27.25
23A Dolomite delivered to M20

***delivered to Hart
22A Gravel delivered to Hart 50 TON $14.50 TON $24.00 TON $19.50
23A Gravel delivered to Hart 50 TON $14.50 TON $24.00 TON $19.50

22A Slag delivered to Hart TON NO BID TON $24.20 TON $25.00
34CS Slag delivered to Hart* 50 TON **$30.00 TON NO BID TON $71.50
25A Slag - Max 3% - LBW TON
H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered to Hart* 50 TON **$30.00 TON $35.25 TON $35.50
8" X 18" Limestone delivered to Hart TON NO BID TON $81.50 TON $94.00
8" X 16" Limestone delivered to Hart
2NS delivered to M20
22A Gravel delivered M20 50 TON $14.50 TON $24.00 TON $19.25
23A Gravel delivered M20 50 TON $14.50 TON $24.00 TON $19.25
22A Slag delivered M20 TON NO BID TON $25.05 TON $24.75
H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered M20* 50 TON **$30.00 TON $36.80 TON $35.25
34CS Slag Delivered M20* 50 TON **$30.00 TON NO BID TON $71.25
25A Slag - Max 3% - LBW
23A Dolomite delivered to M20
Material to be Picked up
2NS (Pit Location) Any TON $5.00 TON NO BID TON NO BID
22A Gravel (Pit Location) Any TON ****$9.90 TON NO BID TON NO BID
23A Gravel (Pit Location) Any TON ****$9.90 TON NO BID TON NO BID
Pit Location if different than listed above

Rip-Rap Plain (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON ~*$75.00 TON NO BID
~*Ludington Yard, MI 

Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway
22A Spread onto North County Road 28 TON $16.50 TON $25.00 TON $21.25
22A Slag Spread onto North County TON NO BID TON $26.15 TON $26.75
23A Spread onto North County Road 28 TON $16.50 TON $25.00 TON $21.25
22A Spread onto South County Road 28 TON $16.50 TON $25.00 TON $20.25
22A Slag Spread onto South County TON NO BID TON $26.85 TON $25.75
23A Spread onto South County Road 28 TON $16.50 TON $25.00 TON $20.25
*Washed/clean Max 2% loss by wash **Natural Equivalent ~*Ludington Yard, MI *** delivered to Hart
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Beckman Bros. Inc. Rieth-Riley Construction Co. Verplank Trucking Company

AGGREGATES

**** Shelby, M-20, Hesperia



COMPANY NAME
ITEM (Delivered) QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE QTY UNIT
23A Dolomite delivered to Hart TON $27.25 TON NO BID TON
23A Dolomite delivered to M20 TON $27.25

22A Gravel delivered to Hart TON NO BID 52 TON $19.30 TON
23A Gravel delivered to Hart TON NO BID 52 TON $19.30 TON

22A Slag delivered to Hart TON $25.25 TON NO BID TON
34CS Slag delivered to Hart* TON $47.75 TON NO BID TON

H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered to Hart* TON $33.00 TON NO BID TON
8" X 18" Limestone delivered to Hart TON $85.00 TON NO BID TON
8" X 16" Limestone delivered to Hart TON NO BID

22A Gravel delivered M20 TON NO BID 52 TON $17.48 TON
23A Gravel delivered M20 TON NO BID 52 TON $17.48 TON
22A Slag delivered M20 TON $25.25 TON NO BID TON
H1 or 32FA Limestone delivered M20* TON $33.00 TON NO BID TON
34CS Slag Delivered M20* TON $47.75 TON NO BID TON

Material to be Picked up
2NS (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON $6.75 TON
22A Gravel (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON $12.50 TON
23A Gravel (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON $12.50 TON
Pit Location if different than listed above

Rip-Rap Plain (Pit Location) TON NO BID TON NO BID TON

Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway
22A Spread onto North County Road TON NO BID 52 TON $20.30 TON
22A Slag Spread onto North County TON $27.50 TON NO BID TON  
23A Spread onto North County Road 22A/23A Limestone TON **$29.5 52 TON $20.30 TON
22A Spread onto South County Road TON NO BID 52 TON $18.48 TON
22A Slag Spread onto South County TON $26.50 TON NO BID TON  
23A Spread onto South County Road 22A/23A Limestone TON **$28.5 52 TON $18.48 TON
*Washed/clean Max 2% loss by wash ** 22A/23A Limestone
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Yellow Rose Transport Alpine Contracting  

AGGREGATES

UNIT PRICE



Item Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price
Bit Mix 13A TON NO BID 50 TON *$84.00 None TON *$78.00 TON NO BID

Location

Bit Mix 36A TON NO BID 50 TON *$87.00 None TON *$78.00 TON NO BID
Location

Bit Mix Commercial Top TON NO BID 20 TON *$82.00 None TON *$78.00 TON NO BID
Location

 
Bit Mix Commercial Base TON NO BID 20 TON *$80.00 None TON *$78.00 TON NO BID

Location

CP5 Delivered Hart TON NO BID TON NO BID TON NO BID N/A TON NO BID
CP 7 Delivered Hart TON NO BID TON NO BID TON NO BID N/A TON NO BID

High Quality (describe) 
delivered Hart 50 TON $147.00 TON NO BID 50 TON **$139.00 TON

QPR **Bond x 84 Bit Mat (Hart)

UPM COLD MIX - Hart 50 TON $154.65
UPM COLD MIX - M20 50 TON $151.17

BITUMINOUS MIXTURES - HOT & COLD
Michigan Paving & Materials Rieth - Riley Construction Co. Unique Paving Materials
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*Plant location

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co

*Plant location*Plant location

*Plant location

*Plant location

*Plant location

*Plant location

*Plant location



Item Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price Min Qty Unit Unit Price
Bit Mix 13A TON NO BID TON TON

Location

Bit Mix 36A TON NO BID TON TON
Location

Bit Mix Commercial Top TON NO BID TON TON
Location

 
Bit Mix Commercial Base TON NO BID TON TON

Location

TON

CP5 Delivered Hart TON NO BID TON TON
CP 7 Delivered Hart TON NO BID TON TON

*High Quality (describe) delivered Hart TON NO BID  TON TON
QPR QPR High Performance Cold Patch CP5*
UPM COLD MIX - Hart 4 pallets 4 PALLETS $3,210.48 TON TON
UPM COLD MIX - M20 10 PALLETS $8,026.20

14 PALLETS $11,236.68 TON TON  

* $12.74 per bag; 50lbs bags and 63 bags to one pallet

QPR

BITUMINOUS MIXTURES - HOT & COLD
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ITEMS Natural (26%-29%) Other 30%-33% 34%-38% Modified 26%-29% 34%-38%

DELIVERED TO TANKS

% of Calcium Chlorides 19-21% 32% 38% Boost 28% 35%
% of Total Chlorides No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F.O.B. Hart Tanks  0.22 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.O.B. M20 Tanks  0.22 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

APPLIED TO ROADS
Application rate per mile (2 lane 

road) 2,500 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi
NW quadrant of county 0.30 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NE quadrant of county 0.30 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SW quadrant of county 0.30 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SE quadrant of county 0.30 /gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

                       Brine and Processed Dust Control                Product Minimum 19% CaCl2
ITEMS Natural (26%-29%) Other 30%-33% 34%-38% Modified 26%-29% 34%-38%

DELIVERED TO TANKS $0.693
$1.239                

MIDeal Pricing 0.652
% of Calcium Chlorides 19-21% 32% 38% Boost 28% 35%

% of Total Chlorides No Bid No Bid 38% No Bid 35% - See Note*
F.O.B. Hart Tanks No Bid No Bid $0.676 No Bid 0.635
F.O.B. M20 Tanks No Bid No Bid $0.692 No Bid 0.651

APPLIED TO ROADS $0.787 $0.746* See Note
Application rate per mile (2 lane 

road) 2,500 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi 2,000 gal/mi
NW quadrant of county No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NE quadrant of county No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SW quadrant of county No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SE quadrant of county No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc

*35% Calcium Chloride will be offered exclusively as a substitute in case where there is a shortage of standard 38% Calcium Chloride
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Brine and Processed Dust Control                   Product Minimum 19% CaCl2
Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC

BRINE

**PRICE INCLUDES THREE (3) FRAC TANKS FOR THE PERIOD OF 5/1/26 TO 9/30/26
**UNLOADING TIME CHARGES:  1ST HOUR FREE, $100 PER ADDITIONAL HOUR OR PORTION THEREOF



Item Quantity Unit Unit Price Extension Quanity Unit Unit Price Extension

Treated SYP Bridge Planking
MBM $7,267.82 MBM

Timber Box Culvert MBM $10,865.45 MBM
Transverse Decking               4", 

6" & 8" MBM $12,012.66 MBM
Treated Bridge and Salt 

Storage Timbers MBM $9,853.06 MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Longitudinal to 12" MBM $11,472.77 MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Longitudinal to 14" MBM $12,417.58 MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 16" MBM $12,717.58 MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 18" MBM $13,277.43 MBM
Panelized Bridge Decks, 

Logitudinal to 20" MBM $15,117.07 MBM
Hardware Pound $27.02 Pound
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BRIDGE DECKS
Krenn Timber Bridge Inc.



Unit Price
ITEM Quantity Unit Alum Extension Quantity Unit Unit Price* Extension Quantity Unit Unit Price Extension

12" - 16 ga CSP ft $9.40 ft $8.99 ft $10.00
15" - 16 ga CSP ft $11.35 ft $11.29 ft $12.00
18" - 16 ga CSP ft $13.70  ft $13.80 ft $15.00
24" - 14 ga CSP ft $23.15 ft $23.37 ft $24.00
30" - 14 ga CSP ft $28.70 ft $29.63 ft $30.00
36" - 14 ga CSP ft $34.90 ft $35.60 ft $36.00
12" - 16 ga CSP Band each $18.80 each $15.73 each $16.50
15" - 16 ga CSP Band each $22.70 each $19.76 each $19.80
18" - 16 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $37.00 each $27.60 each $30.00
24" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $57.40 each $46.74  each $48.00
30" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each $69.80 each $59.26  each $60.00
36" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length each NO BID each $71.20  each $72.00
Minimum Truck Capacity in Pounds N/A N/A

*CSP Unit Price Prices firm 45 days from bid date. 

1% 10 Net 30. Terms 1% 10 Net 30 Net 30 days
Prices will remain firm for 90 days

Pricing is firm until April 3rd, 2026, no delivery charge 
or minimum order charge.

Prices include full truck delivery to yard or jobsite. Less 
than truck load quantities, freight charges may apply.  
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CULVERTS
ALL PIPE AND BANDS MUST BE ALUMINIZED TYPE 2

Cadillac Culvert Inc. Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. St Regis Culvert Inc. 

Minimum load to include freight is $7,000.00.
FOB Oceana County, 4-6 weeks / ARO.



NON OPERATED HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000# NO BID NO BID
Pulverizer, 7' width NO BID NO BID
Hi-Ranger (describe) NO BID NO BID
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd NO BID NO BID
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH NO BID NO BID

OPERATED
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000# $200.00 $2,200.00 $8,300.00 $35,200.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pulverizer, 7' width NO BID NO BID
Hi-Ranger (describe) NO BID NO BID
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd $175.00 $1,700.00 $7,300.00 $28,300.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Semi Train - (Tractor, Dump Lead, Dump Pup) $200.00 $190.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH NO BID $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Semi with Dump Lead $175.00 $145.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Boom Truck 16 tons N/A $175.00
Long Reach Excavator 64ft N/A $160.00

Alpine Contracting, LLC 

EQUIPMENT RENTAL
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Ken Adams Excavating Inc. 



NON OPERATED HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY HOURLY DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000# NO BID
Pulverizer, 7' width NO BID
Hi-Ranger (describe) NO BID  
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd NO BID
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH NO BID

 
OPERATED
Excavator, Long Carriage, 40,000# $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pulverizer, 7' width $470.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hi-Ranger (describe) **$150.00 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
Loader, Articulating, 5-6 cyd $160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Semi Train - (Tractor, Dump Lead, Dump Pup) NO BID
Screen Deck, 3 Products, 400+TPH $175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Semi with Dump Lead $145.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Mill 4' $520.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Mill 7' $655.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

** Hi-Ranger 100'
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EQUIPMENT RENTAL
 Hallack Contracting, Inc.


	Cover
	Aggregates
	BIT MIX
	Brine & Dust Control
	Bridge Decks
	Culverts
	Equipment
	Contacts

